



## Montgomery College Procurement Office

900 Hungerford Drive, Suite 110

Rockville, MD 20850

[www.montgomerycollege.edu/procure](http://www.montgomerycollege.edu/procure)

### BID 514-003 - CHEMICAL INSTRMENTATION & ACCESSORIES

Bid Opening Date/Time August 08, 2013 at 3:00 p.m.		Purchasing Agent Cherree Adams			
GROUP ITEM NO. I	Agilent Technologies	Thermo Electron North America, LLC	Sanusek, LLC	Thermo Fisher Scientific	Shimadzu
2.2.1 (total 3 each)	NO BID	\$81,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.2	NO BID	included	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.3	NO BID	included	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.4	NO BID	included	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.5	NO BID	\$2,070.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.6	NO BID	\$4,314.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.7 (shipping)	NO BID	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.8 (installation)	NO BID	included	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.9 (delivery)	NO BID	less than 30 days	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.10 (warranty)	NO BID	1 year	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTALS</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$87,484.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
GROUP ITEM NO. II	Agilent Technologies	Thermo Electron North America, LLC	Sanusek, LLC	Thermo Fisher Scientific	Shimadzu
2.2.1	\$52,701.60	NO BID	NO BID	\$49,360.00	\$70,574.78
2.2.2	\$2,590.40	NO BID	NO BID	included	
2.2.3	\$1,764.80	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,260.00	
2.2.4 (shipping)	included	NO BID	NO BID	\$325.00	\$185.00
2.2.5 (installation)	\$930.00	NO BID	NO BID	included	
2.2.6 (delivery)	49 days	NO BID	NO BID	35-45 days	30 days
2.2.7 (warranty)	1 year	NO BID	NO BID	included	1 year
<b>TOTALS</b>	<b>\$57,986.80</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$50,945.00</b>	<b>\$70,759.78</b>
GROUP ITEM NO. III	Agilent Technologies	Thermo Electron North America, LLC	Sanusek, LLC	Thermo Fisher Scientific	Shimadzu
2.2.1	\$39,316.80	NO BID	NO BID	\$23,954.45	\$39,778.75
2.2.2	included	NO BID	NO BID	included	
2.2.3 (shipping)	included	NO BID	NO BID	\$300.00	\$185.00
2.2.4 (installation)	included	NO BID	NO BID	included	
2.2.5 (delivery)	7 day	NO BID	NO BID	90 days	30 days
2.2.6 (warranty)	1 year	NO BID	NO BID	included	1 year
<b>TOTALS</b>	<b>\$39,316.80</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$24,254.45</b>	<b>\$39,963.75</b>
GROUP ITEM NO. IV	Agilent Technologies	Thermo Electron North America, LLC	Sanusek, LLC	Thermo Fisher Scientific	Shimadzu
2.2.1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.2 (shipping)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.3 (installation)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.4 (delivery)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.2.5 (warranty)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTALS</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>

Vendor's Specific Equipment Bidded